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Monday July 3rd 2017 

Today was a Buy day. We were looking for a decline and ES,YM and TF reached or surpassed their 
Violation levels before the decline started. NQ reversed at its PH level. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Markets will be open only till 1PM EST. We should be looking for some kind of 
rally 

Enjoy your 4th of July   

 



Tuesday July 4th 2017 

 

 

 

 



Wednesday July 5th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets tested their yesterday’s low and then the real rally started. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue.  

 

 



Thursday July 6th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets tried to rally but some failed to get back to their BDL during the day session. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Markets are at or below their projected levels, therefore the rally could start at 
anytime.  

 



Friday July 7th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. As expected the decline was in and the rally got going early. 

Monday will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue but we could also be in for a confused day. 

 



Monday July 10th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets rallied in a confused manner, maybe it was caused by TF switching 
exchange.  

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue but we could be in for some more 
confusion 

I am still using the TF instrument for now until volume switches over.  

 



Tuesday July 11th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets were really confused, retesting their BDL and rallying again. Maybe the TF 
switch is creating some manipulating. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts. 

 



Wednesday July 12th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets did produce a small decline in the overnight session, but failed to do so in 
the day session. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. I would be looking for a confused day in order to compensate for today’s failure.  

 



Thursday July 13th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused and didn’t get anywhere 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Depending of the market, targets have been reached, therefore the decline 
could start at anytime.  

 



Friday July 14th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets continued their rally and surpassed their Penetration levels. 

Monday will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts. 

 

 



Monday July 17th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets were slow and produced a small decline. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue but we could be in for a confused day.   

 

 



Tuesday July 18th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused and only YM failed to make a positive rally during the day 
session. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Since YM still need to get above its BDL I believe that the rally should continue  

 



Wednesday July 19th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets continued their rally and reached their TTT target. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts.  

 



Thursday July 20th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Momentum did take markets higher before a smaller than expected decline toke 
place. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. We could be in for a confused day tomorrow as it is summer Friday and not 
much really happened today.  

 



Friday July 21st 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused and retested yesterday’s lows, however TF and YM failed to 
close above it. 

Monday will be a SS day. Markets should get back above their BDL. Once accomplished, all bets are off and 
the decline could start. 

 



Monday July 24th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets rallied as hard as they could but once YM was above the BDL and TF was 3 
ticks away, The decline started. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. There is room for the decline to continue but we may be looking at a confused 
day. 

 



Tuesday July 25th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. It was a confused day with all markets making a small decline on the 24 hours 
session  but 2 failed to do it in the day session. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue but I would be looking for confusion.   

 



Wednesday July 26th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused as all 4 couldn’t go in the same direction all day. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Markets are all above their BDL with room to continue their rally. Having said 
that the decline could start at any time.   

 



Thursday July 27th 2017 

Today was a SS day. All but YM did decline but YM closed on the day’s high. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. We should be looking for a decline in YM and that should drag the others.  

 



Friday July 28th 2017 

Today was  a Buy day. Markets tried to test yesterday’s lows and failed to break through. Then the rally 
started. 

Monday will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue, however it could be in a confused way. 

 



Monday July 31st 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets rallied during the overnight session and then got confused as expected. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue. However once all Markets are above 
their BDL for the day session, the decline could start at any time. 

 



Tuesday August 1st 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets were confused but managed to continue their rally. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Having close on the highs of the day, momentum may take markets higher 
before the decline starts.  

 



Wednesday August 2nd 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Momentum did take the markets higher then the decline started. After failing to 
breach yesterday’s low, the rally started. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue, however it may be in a confused way. 

 



Thursday August 3rd 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused and probably TF had something to do with it as it closed 
below it’s BDL 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. TF needs to get back above its BDL then all bets are off .  

 



Friday August 4th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Once TF rejected its BDL then some kind of rally started; mostly confused. 

Monday will be a Buy day. There is room for the decline to continue. 

 



Monday August 7th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. The decline was smaller than average.  

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is plenty of room for the rally to continue, however I wouldn’t be 
surprised if we retested today’s low.  

 



Tuesday August 8th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets rallied and hit their Targeted 3 day rally and then declined again to retest 
their BDL. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Based on averages markets should rally again. However once they are above 
their BDL during the day session, all bets are off.   

 



Wednesday August 9th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets tried hard to rally in order to get ES and YM above their BDL. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts.  

 



Thursday August 10th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets decline hard and surpassed all TTT levels. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Having closed on the lows of the day, momentum may take markets lower 
before the rally starts.  

 

 



Friday August 11th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. As expected markets did retest yesterday’s low and then rallied 

Monday will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue. However if we open above the BDL for the 
day session. The decline could start at any time. 

 

 



Monday August 14th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets rallied hard and surpassed all TTT levels. Only the TTT range levels could 
have kept you in the long longer. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Having closed on the highs of the day, momentum may take markets higher 
before the decline starts.   

 



Tuesday August 15th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. As expected markets went higher before the decline started. Also the decline found 
resistance at the Range level.  

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue, however it may in a confused way.  

 



Wednesday August 16th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused with some retesting their BDL. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue however the confusion may continue.  

 



Thursday August 17th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets managed to get a rally for the day session, then the decline started. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets lower before the rally starts.  

 



Friday August 18th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets tested their previous day low , then rallied to it their future 3 day rally 
numbers only to come back to retest their previous day low. 

Monday will be a Sell day. Based on today’s action I would be looking for a confused day 

 



Monday August 21st 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets retested their BDL and some nearly reached their Violation levels. Then the 
rally started. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is plenty of room for the rally to continue, However once the day session 
opens above the BDL then the decline could start at any time.  

 



Tuesday August 22nd 2017 

Today was a SS day. The markets retested the PH levels and continued rallying all day and surpassed all 
TTT levels.   

Tomorrow will be a Buy Day.  Momentum may take the markets higher before the decline starts. 

 



Wednesday August 23rd 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets retested yesterday’s high early in the overnight session, then a confused 
decline started. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Having closed near the lows of the day, momentum may take markets lower 
before the rally starts.    

 



Thursday August 24th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Momentum did take markets lower and then they rallied in a very confused way. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. As long as we open above the BDL for the day session tomorrow then the 
direction could be confused. 

 

 



Friday August 25th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Some retested their BDL then rallied and decline again. Very confused 

Monday will be a Buy day. There is room for the decline to continue. 

 

 

 



Monday August 28th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets tested their previous day low and failed to go much lower as it was the TTT 
MA levels. The rally then started. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. The rally is half way done, which may make for a continued confused rally.  

 

 

 



Tuesday August 29th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Some of the markets gaped down in the globex session which is rare. Most reached 
their Violation levels and a rally started. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue, and Momentum should take markets 
higher before the decline starts.  

 

 



Wednesday August 30th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets rallied and some reached their Penetration levels. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts.  

 

 

 



Thursday August 31st 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Over Night Markets barely produced a decline and then rallied. Day session didn’t get 
a decline 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. What happened today is rare and markets may try to negate that by declining 
1st and then rallying  

 

 



Friday September 1st 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets continued rallying and reached their Penetration levels. 

Monday will be a SS day. As it will be a short day, the decline could start at any time 

 

 

 



Monday September 4th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets all acted different but all managed to produce a positive 3 day rally. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. We should be looking for a decline.  

 

 

 



Tuesday September 5th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. As expected we did get a decline. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Except for NQ, the others have room for the rally to continue. Because of NQ 
we may get a confused day.  

 

 

 



Wednesday September 6th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets rallied and reached their TTT levels before pulling back a little. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue, however if we open above the BDL, the 
decline could start at any time. 

WE WILL ROLLOVER ON FRIDAY SINCE IT WILL BE A BUY DAY AND THE START OF A NEW CYCLE 

 

 



Thursday September 7th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets decline declined but in a confused way. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. We should be looking for some kind of decline before the rally starts. 

 

 

 



Friday September 8th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets did produce a decline with ES retesting yesterday’s low and others reaching 
their TTT levels. 

Monday will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue but it may be in a confused way. 

 

 

 



Monday September 11th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets rallied hard and surpassed all levels. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts.  

 

 

 

 



Tuesday September 12th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets continued their rally and reached Penetration levels. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts.  

 



Wednesday September 13th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets did decline, however it was a below average decline. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue.  

 



Thursday September 14th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets retested their BDL with NG dipping much lower than the others. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. NQ need to get back above it’s BDL. Will it lead or will the others drag it back 
up. That is the question.  

 



Friday September 15th 2017 

Today was a SS day. YM and ES rallied hard and YM did reach it’s TTT levels. 

Monday will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts. 

 

 

 



Monday September 18th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets were confused  but most made a small decline even for the day session. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue. 

 



Tuesday September 19th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused and threaded water all day. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is plenty of room for the rally to continue. However if we open above the 
BDL tomorrow, all bets are off and the decline could start at any time.  

 



Wednesday September 20th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Most markets managed to continue their rally, even if some were confused. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts.  

 

 

 

 



Thursday September 21st 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets tested yesterday’s high and failed. The decline then started.  

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Markets started some kind of rally which should continue tomorrow.  

 

 

 



Friday September 22nd 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused but all but YM closed above yesterday’s lows. 

Monday will be a SS day. Once YM gets above it’s BDL, then the decline could start at anytime. 

 

 

 



Monday September 25th 2017 

Today was a SS day. All Markets except NT made a positive 3 day rally. NQ is the only one having issues 
with the day session. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. We should be looking for a decline tomorrow. 

 

 



Tuesday September 26th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. The decline was not as much as expected. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue. 

 



Wednesday September 27th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused as they retested the BDL and then rallied again and managed 
to reach their TTT levels. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue. However if we open tomorrow above the 
BDL  then the decline could start at any time.  

 



Thursday September 28th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets couldn’t rally much and played with the previous day high. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts. 

 

 



Friday September 29th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. The decline was small and then the rally started. 

Monday will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue, however we could be in for a confused 
day. 

 



Monday October 2nd 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets rallied and most surpassed their TTT levels. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Since most markets are at their # day rally levels, The decline could start at any 
time.  

 



Tuesday October 3rd 2017 

Today was a SS day. Momentum did take markets higher. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Having closed on the highs of the day, Momentum may takes markets higher 
before the decline starts.   

 



Wednesday October 4th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets did produce a decline but it was smaller than average. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is plenty of room for the rally to continue.  

 



Thursday October 5th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused, which is normal for a Sell day, with some markets reaching 
their TTT levels and some not even surpassing their previous day high. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Since all markets closed above their BDL, the decline could start at any time. 
Let’s see what the big news will do to change that 

 



Friday October 6th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets did decline but in a confused way. 

Monday will be a Buy day. There is room for the decline to continue. 

 



Monday October 9th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. As expected Momentum did take markets higher before the decline started. Late in 
the day a rally started. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. The rally should continue but we could get a retest of today’s low first 

 



Tuesday October 10th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused but when YM and ES nearly reached their target they really 
became confused with rallies and declines. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue before the decline starts.  

 



Wednesday October 11th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets retraced at first, NQ even retested it’s BDL, then the rally resumed but failed 
to reach averages. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Most closed on the high’s for the day. Momentum may take markets higher 
before the decline starts.  

 



Thursday October 12th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Some of the markets did follow the momentum and penetrated the Previous day 
High, then the decline started and finally some rally started at the end of the day. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. The is plenty of room for the rally to continue. We may be in for some 
confusion. 

 



Friday October 13th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets rallied to yesterday’s high where they found resistance, 

Monday will be a SS day. There is room for the 3 day rally to continue. Having said that, the decline could 
start at any time 

 



Monday October 16th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets were confused with YM and NQ rallying nonstop and TF retesting its BDL. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take YW and NQ higher before the decline starts. 

 



Tuesday October 17th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. All markets did produce a decline. However the day session decline for YM was very 
small and showing signs of bullishness. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is plenty of room for the rally to continue and momentum should help.  

 

 



Wednesday October 18th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. YM rallied hard and surpassed all levels while the others rallied but in a confused 
way. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue, however the decline could also start at 
anytime.  

 



Thursday October 19th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Talk about a confused market. They all dropped like rocks but then rallied back up  
and only NQ failed to get back above its BDL for the day session. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. With most markets having closed on their high’s for the day, momentum may 
take them higher before the decline starts.  

 



Friday October 20th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. All markets did produce a minimal decline during the Globex session, however only 
NQ did get a decline during the day session. That could be looking as a bullish sign unless reversed during 
Monday’s session. 

Monday will be a Sell day. We could be looking for a confused session. 

 



Monday October 23rd 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were very confused. ES and YM made and/or surpassed their TTT Level 
while TF and NQ got rejected at their previous day high 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. TF and NQ are below their BDL and based on averages they should get back 
above sometime before the close tomorrow. 

 



Tuesday October 24th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets rallied hard but not hard enough for TF and NQ to make it above their day 
session BDL. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. We should be looking for a decline but based on today’s action we may be in 
for a confused decline.  

 



Wednesday October 25th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. The decline was more than expected and some reached their TTT Range levels 
before starting to rally. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Most of the rally is in place which could make for a confused day.  

 

 



Thursday October 26th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. As expected, markets rallied in a confused way. But all surpassed their TTT levels for 
the day. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Markets are at or close to their average 3 day rally levels, therefore the decline 
could start at any time   

 



Friday October 27th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets continued their rally. 

Monday will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts 

 



Monday October 30th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Most markets declined and reached their TTT levels. NQ was a bit different as it 
reached its penetration levels then decline and used its range for the day as a goal for reversing. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue but it may be in a confused way.   

 



Tuesday October 31st 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets did continue their rally but as expected it was confused. Only NQ reached a 
target. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Will the rally continue or will the decline start early, that is the question.  

 



Wednesday November 1st 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets continued their rally and reached their TTT levels. Then the decline started. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. There is room for the decline to continue and momentum may help markets go 
lower before the rally starts.  

 



Thursday November 2nd 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets declined and some reached their TTT levels and some reached their 
Violation levels before reversing. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Good part of the rally is in place, therefore the rally should continue, but it could 
be a confused rally.  

 



Friday November 3rd 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were confused but the rally did continue. 

Monday will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue. However based on current levels, the 
decline could start at any time. 

 



Monday November 6th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets continued their rally and most surpassed all their TTT levels. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts. 

 



Tuesday November 7th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. As expected, markets rallied higher and retested this high before the decline started. 
Based on these new high the Range indicator predicted a new possible low which was reached. At that point 
the rally started. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is plenty of room for this new rally to continue. 

 



Wednesday November 8th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Some markets tested ot Violated yesterday’s low before the real rally started. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue. Also momentum should take markets 
higher before the decline starts.  

 



Thursday November 9th 2017 

Today was a SS day. This was a very confused day. Markets declined overnight and opened below their 
BDL, only to rally right back above. Then a decline started only to be reversed in the second half of the day.  

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Today really performed as a Buy day. As long as we open the day session 
below today’s high, this afternoon rally may just continue  

 



Friday November 10th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets reached their TTT levels before the rally started. 

Monday will be a Sell day. The rally should continue. 

 



Monday November 13th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets tested Friday’s low and then rallied again to Friday’s high. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Based on averages there is room for the rally to continue. However if the 
markets open tomorrow morning above their BDL then the decline could start at any time.  

 



Tuesday November 14th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets were confused as they rallies and declined to the BDL all day. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. There is plenty of room for the decline to continue.  

 



Wednesday November 15th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets declined and reached their Violation levels before rallying. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. About half the rally is in place which could make for a confused day.  

 



Thursday November 16th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Forget confusion markets rallied and surpassed all TTT levels. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. The decline could start at any time, however today’s momentum may take 
markets higher before it starts.  

 



Friday November 17th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets started their decline at the open last night and kept going all day. 

Monday will be a Buy day. There is room for the decline to continue and momentum should help do that. 

 



Monday November 20th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets did continue their decline and most reached or surpassed their TTT MA 
level. Then a rally started. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. A good part of the rally is in place, which could make for a confused day.    

 



Tuesday November 21st 2017 

Today was Sell day. Markets rallied hard and surpassed all TTT Levels. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Markets are above their 3 day rally targets. Therefore the decline could start at 
any time. 

 



Wednesday November 22nd 2017 

Today was a SS day. As expected the rally was in place and the decline started at the open last night. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Being a short holiday day, the decline could continue but may be smaller than 
expected.  

 



Thursday November 23rd 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets did decline and most reached their TTT levels. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue.  

 



Friday November 24th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets continues their rally. 

Monday will be a SS day. There is room for the rally to continue but the decline could start at any time. 

 



Monday November 27th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets were confused as they retested a few time Friday’s high. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. There is plenty of room for the decline to go.  

 



Tuesday November 28th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Most of the decline happened overnight when markets tried to test their previous day 
low. Then the rally started. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Depending of the instrument, the rally is in place. However having closed near 
the highs of the day, momentum may take markets higher and then could be confused for the rest of the 
day.  

 



Wednesday November 29th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. All but NQ performed well for a Sell day and had a confused day. NQ took a nose 
dive for some reason. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Will the others pull up NQ above it’s BDL, that will be the question for the day. 

 



Thursday November 30th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets rallied a many surpassed their maximum TTT levels as they were trying to get 
NQ back to its BDL. NQ got close but then the decline started. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. There is some room for the decline to continue, however the rally could also 
start at any time.  

 



Friday December 1st 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets declined hard and surpassed all TTT levels. Then the rally started and 
recuperated nearly all of the decline. 

Monday will be a Sell day. Markets have rallied way past their Rally levels, which should make for a 
confused day. 

 



Monday December 4th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. After a big gap up Sunday night, which surpassed all TTT levels, markets reversed 
and declined for most of the day.  

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Markets are above their 3 day rally levels, therefore the decline could continue 
at any time.  

 



Tuesday December 5th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets tried to rally a bit but failed and the decline continued and reached Violation 
Levels. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Markets are at or lower than their TTT Levels. Momentum may take markets 
lower before the rally starts.  

 



Wednesday December 6th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Momentum did take markets lower, then, a somewhat confused rally started. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. There is room for the rally to continue however it may be confused. 

THE NUMBERS ON THIS REPORT ARE BASED ON THE MARCH 2018 CONTRACT SINCE TODAY 
WAS A BUY DAY AND THE START OF THE NEW CYCLE.  

 



Thursday December 7th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets did produce a confused rally with some testing yesterday’s lows and all of 
them rallying back and forth all day. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. All but ES have surpassed their 3 day target. Therefore the decline could start at 
any time.  

 



Friday December 8th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets continued their rally and reached their Penetration levels. Some even 
surpassed that and reach their predicted Range levels. 

Monday will be a Buy day. YM and ES closed on their highs for the day, therefor momentum may take them 
higher before the decline starts. 

 



Monday December 11th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets produced a very small decline and rallied hard during the day session. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Most of the rally is in place which could make for a confused day.  

 



Tuesday December 12th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Most reached their TTT levels but some were confused like TF which closed close to 
yesterday’s low. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the 3 day rally to continue.  

 



Wednesday December 13th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets continued their rally and some even reached their maximum Penetration 
levels after which time the decline started.. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. There is room for the decline to continue. 

 



Thursday December 14th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets decline and some reached their TTT levels or their TTT Range levels. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Momentum may take markets lower before the rally starts.  

 



Friday December 15th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets rallied from the open last night and never looked back. 

Monday will be a SS day. Although markets are above their Average 3 day rally, Momentum may take 
markets higher before the decline starts. 

.  



Monday December 18th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets continued their rally and surpassed all the TTT levels. Some found resistance 
at their TTT Range levels. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. Momentum may take markets higher before the decline starts.  

 

 



Tuesday December 19th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets tested their previous day high and then the decline started and most reached 
their TTT levels. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Having closed near the lows of the day, momentum may take markets lower 
before the rally starts.  

 



Wednesday December 20th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets were very confused as the rallied, pulled back, rallied and pulled back again. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. Based on averages, markets should rally tomorrow. But as long as they get 
above their BDL during the day session then the decline could start at any time 

 

 



Thursday December 21st 2017 

Today was a SS day. Markets tested their BDL and then rallied  and tested yesterday’s highs.. then declined 
again. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. There is room for the decline to continue. 

 

 



Friday December 22nd 2017 

Today was a Buy day. Markets declined and nearly reached their TTT levels before rallying. 

Tuesday will be a Sell day. We should be looking for some kind of rally on this day after the holiday. 

Have a great Holiday weekend   

 



Tuesday December 26th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Slow confused day it was with markets going nowhere. 

Tomorrow will be a SS day. There is room for the 3 day rally to continue, however as long as we are above 
the BDL at some point during the day session tomorrow, then the decline could start at any time  

 

 



Wednesday December 27th 2017 

Today was a SS day. Most markets tested yesterday’s high, then the decline started. 

Tomorrow will be a Buy day. There is room for the decline to continue.  

 

 



Thursday December 28th 2017 

Today was a Buy day. We did get some declined but it looked very confused. 

Tomorrow will be a Sell day. Probably more confusion as the year end window dressing continues.  

 

 



Friday December 29th 2017 

Today was a Sell day. Markets rallied hard only to take a year end nose dive. 

Tuesday will be a SS day. All markets closed below their BDL. Based on TTT they should all try to rally at 
least to that level. 

Have a great and prosperous New Year.  

 



Tuesday January 2nd 2018 

 

 


